



CITY OF NORTH LITTLE ROCK 22-3782 BID SUMMARY  
August 4, 2022 @ 10:00 a.m.

Demolition and Site Clearance at Seventeen (17) Locations	G. Hoops	Navona	MG Trucks	Page Construction
5% Bid Bond	Yes	Yes	Yes	NO BID BOND
717 East 14 <sup>th</sup> Street \$	6,200.00	5,382.00	3,800.00	
4808 Haywood Street \$	7,300.00	10,584.00	5,650.00	
1600 Orange Street \$	8,800.00	20,950.00	7,800.00	
512 Dorothy Drive \$	7,200.00	14,103.00	8,250.00	
2206 East Washington Avenue \$	10,400.00	NO BID	7,200.00	
3 West Avalon Drive \$	9,65.00	20,538.00	11,900.00	
1212 Graham Avenue \$	7,400.00	12,789.00	6,150.00	
1424 West 18 <sup>th</sup> Street \$	13,600.00	19,440.00	17,450.00	
129 College Park \$	NO BID	11,124.00	8,500.00	

Opened by: Amy Smith  
Summary by: Crystal Willis



CITY OF NORTH LITTLE ROCK 22-3782 BID SUMMARY  
August 4, 2022 @ 10:00 a.m.

Demolition and Site Clearance at Seventeen (17) Locations	G. Hoops	Navona	MG Trucks	
4724 Gum Street \$	7,400.00	14,607.00	6,750.00	
4508 Rogers Street \$	NO BID	8,127.00	6,900.00	
229 Mosley Street \$	7,600.00	11,997.00	5,800.00	
201 College Park Circle \$	NO BID	14,760.00	11,900.00	
615 West 33 <sup>rd</sup> Street \$	NO BID	15,300.00	9,500.00	
816 West 34th Street \$	6,350.00	11,025.00	5,800.00	
5109 Alpha Street \$	NO BID	8,082.00	4,950.00	
1304 North Walnut Street \$	NO BID	6,255.00	4,500.00	